Municipal Solid Waste Hauling Services and Landfill Services

City Project No. 17-13-M

Bid Opening: March 5, 2014 - 2:30 p.m., City Hall Council Chambers

Company

Company

Company

Company

Mt. View Landfill

RR Waste Solutions

Burgmeier;s Hauling, Inc.

Western MD Waste

13300 New Goerges Creek 1192 McClellandtown
Rd SW 4004 E. Hwy 290 W 1356 Old Sixth Ave. Road |Road
McClellandtown, PA
Frostburg, MD 21532 Dripping Springs, TX 78620 |Altoona, PA 16601 15458
Affidavit Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted
Bid Bond Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted
Local Preference Submitted - County N/A Submitted - City Submitted - County
RFI 1-3 Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted
Addendum 1 Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted
OPTION A- Hauling Services
Mt. View Landfill year 1 NOBID | $ 1,201,104.67 | $ 749,616.00 NO BID
Mt. View Landfill Year 2 NOBID | $ 1,237,137.81 | $ 749,616.00 NO BID
Mt. View Landfill Year 3 NOBID | $ 1,274,251.95 | $ 749,616.00 NO BID
Mostoller Landfill Year 1 NO BID NOBID | S 906,756.00 NO BID
Mostoller Landfill Year 2 NO BID NOBID | § 906,756.00 NO BID
Mostoller Landfille Year 3 NO BID NOBID | $ 906,756.00 NO BID
Other Year 1 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 1,064,400.00
Other Year 2 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 1,086,000.00
Other Year 3 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 1,107,600.00
(WMWS Transfer
Station)
OPTION B - Curbside recyclables
Pickup
A- Solid Waste Bidder
Year 1 NO BID NOBID | $ 145,500.00 | $ 116,400.00
Year 2 NO BID NOBID | S 145,500.00 | $ 118,800.00
Year 3 NO BID NOBID | $ 145,500.00 | $ 121,200.00
B-Independent of Waste Bid
Year 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Year 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Year 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Option C - Curbside Recyclables
Bid submitted NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OPTION D - Curbside Bulk
Cost per hour NOBID | S 200.75 | $ 115.00 | S 65.00
OPTION E - Landfill Services
Rate per ton S 34.50 NO BID NOBID | $ 45.00
Fix rate? No - CPl years 2 and 3 NO BID NO BID Yes
Includes landfill services fees? Yes NO BID NO BID Yes




